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All About College & University Graduations

Graduating from college or university,
www.graduationcardsshop.com/college_university/categorycontent-1.htm is a huge accomplishment.

Feb. 19, 2008 - PRLog -- It is that time of the year you had been waiting for! College graduation, or
university graduation http://www.graduationcardsshop.com/College_University_Graduation is a
culmination of years of quality education. For some, the anticipation has been just too much! And you
know that your excitement is culminating in a grand celebration, the much awaited graduation ceremony.
As you don your graduation robe and receive your diploma elegantly on the dais, you surely want to see
your loved ones cheering for you with pride and uncontained joy. You have been building a strong
foundation for yourself, aided by teachers and parents. Now is the time to tell the world that you are ready
to face the wide world by sending college graduation announcements or university graduation invitations
cards with unique styles!

Graduating from college or university,
http://www.graduationcardsshop.com/college_university/categorycontent-1.htm is a huge accomplishment
so it only makes sense that the graduate wants to announce to everyone that they have graduated. Sending
college graduation announcements is the perfect way to tell everyone of your accomplishments. There are
standard college graduation announcements and that can be purchased, and many campuses will offer these.
But making one’s college graduation announcements 
http://www.cardsshoppe.com/productlist.asp?catid=10 stand apart from the rest is just as easy.

To make a college graduation announcement or university graduation announcement truly unique, the
invitations can include a photo of the graduate. These graduation photos are usually taken before graduation
so there is plenty of time to have the photos placed on the college graduation cards. If the graduate finds a
design for a card that they truly love and want to use, the photo can be mailed along with the college
graduation announcements.

Custom college graduation invitations, http://www.graduationcardsshop.com/college_university/car... can
be personalized in the same way. These graduation cards are used to invite family and friends to the
graduation ceremony. If the graduation photos are not ready when the college graduation invitations are
sent, there are still other ways to personalize the cards. Placing a quote inside the affordable college
graduation announcements can be very inspirational. This quote can be one of the graduate’s favorites, or it
can be a quote about looking to the future, or one that emphasizes how far the graduate has come. Many
people who will be receiving the college graduation invitations will be keeping these cards as a keepsake of
your big day so it’s nice to have them be more personal than just a standard college graduation invitation or
a standard university graduation invitation.

And personalizing, the college graduation cards don’t stop there. If there is to be a separate graduation party
or celebration for the graduate, college graduation party invitations can also be personalized. A wonderful
way to personalize these cards is to add confetti, either inside the actual college graduation party
invitations, or the confetti can be placed inside the party invitation envelope. Either way, the confetti will
sprinkle around the recipient when they receive the card, and they will already be in a celebratory spirit!
College graduation open house invitations can be done in much the same way. These invitations can have
confetti such as star confetti added to them to let everyone know that the graduate has become a star with
all their years of hard work.

So, your son, daughter or loved one is graduating from college. It is the perfect chance to show how proud
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you are, by organizing a college graduation party to celebrate the joyous occasion. What about a surprise
university graduation party? There are many online college graduation party invitations 
http://www.cardspersonalized.com/College-University-Gradu... blank as well as aptly-worded university
graduation party invitations, for you to choose from. What about sending printed, photo, customized and
unique cards for graduation open house invitations.

When sending university college graduation announcements, college graduation invitations, college
graduation open house invitations, college graduation party invitations, people may send along gifts to
congratulate the graduate on their huge accomplishment. In this case, college graduation thank you cards
and university graduation thank you cards need to be sent. These college graduation cards and should be
personalized with the same theme as the other graduation cards.

# # #

Graduation Cards Shop, http://www.graduationcardsshop.com CardsShoppe http://www.cardsshoppe.com
and Cards Personalized http://www.cardspersonalized.com were started in 2001 to provide unique and
exclusive Graduation Invitations, announcements and cards. Customers can add their own wordings, select
the text size, fonts and type style and then instantly preview their cards before they buy. They also offer
free shipping, 10 free cards and same day printing shipping. Proofs are sent within 1 hour.

Website: www.cardsshoppe.com
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