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Sarah Cochran,Youngest ever to Give Opening Invocation to GAMA International’s LAMP Mtg

Sarah Cochran, be Youngest ever to Receive Honor of Giving Opening Invocation to GAMA International’s
Leadership and Management Program

July 1, 2008 - PRLog -- LAS VEGAS, NV -- The Gallacher Agency of American National Insurance and
the Great Basin Region wish to congratulate Sarah Cochran on being the youngest member of GAMA
International ever to give the Opening Invocation of the organization’s annual Leadership and Management
Program, which is being held this year in San Francisco,  March 16-19, 2008.

Sarah Cochran is the Personal Lines Manager for the Great Basin Region of American National Insurance
Company.  It is because of Sarah’s commitment to GAMA International through her active role as an
inaugural member of the Leaders of Today and Tomorrow (LoTT) that she was given the honor presenting
the invocation.  

The Gallacher Agency of American National Insurance has been a community leader in providing estate
and risk coordination to its clientele throughout Nevada since 1988, through the use of its multiple lines of
insurance products and their related services.  

The Great Basin Region of American National Insurance is led by Regional Director Ken Gallacher and
Associate Regional Director Terry Cochran.  The Great Basin Region of American National Insurance
encompasses all American National agencies within Nevada, Utah, Idaho, and Southern California.

To learn more about American National Insurance and its family of companies, please visit
www.anico.com or www.anpac.com.  

GAMA International is a worldwide professional association serving 5,500 field leaders in the insurance
and financial services industry.  Its members recognize their critical role in finding, building and inspiring
the next generation of top performers who will, in their turn, lead the industry into the future.  To help build
these leaders, the association provides its members with professional development resources and
opportunities, including educational, networking and leadership.  GAMA International’s Web site is located
at www.gamaweb.com

# # #

Chartered in 1905, American National Insurance Company has evolved into an industry leader, ranking
among the largest of life insurance companies in the United States.
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Today, the company and its subsidiaries provide personalized service to more than 5 million policyholders
throughout 50 states, the District of Columbia, Puerto Rico, and American Samoa. Through its subsidiary,
American National de México, Compañía de Seguros de Vida, American National is authorized to sell its
products in Mexico. 

Directly and through subsidiaries, the company offers a broad line of insurance products and services,
including life insurance, annuities, health insurance, property and casualty, credit insurance, and pension
plan services. Mutual funds and variable products are securities products distributed through Securities
Management and Research, Inc., a subsidiary broker-dealer of American National Insurance Company.

--- End ---
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