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Gemstones and Crystals for Protection against Evil Eye Energies and Forces

Here you will find information about Natural Gemstones and Crystals that protect against Evil Eyes of
other people, negative energies and forces.

Aug. 9, 2009 - PRLog -- PROTECTION POWERS of Tiger Eye Gemstone:

TIGER EYE is a Very Strong Stone. It Unites so many powers all together. It brings protection from the
Evil Eye. Tigers Eye Stone is also used for protection against all forms of danger. It always been considered
Strong TALISMAN in many cultures, especially against the Evil Eye. Tiger Eye was used by Aztecs to
Protect their HOME from Negative Forces and Energies of their enemies. They Believed that Tiger Eye
Stone will Keep their Home and Family Safe at all times. It was believed that a person possessing one could
see everything, even behind closed doors. Tiger Eye stone has been used through the ages to avert the Evil
Eye. Tiger Eye helps to defeat negative forces. Because of its ever-changing appearance when viewed from
different angles, it helps the person using it to become all seeing, able to view different ways of observing a
situation. This Stone Universally thought to bring GOOD Fortune and to Protect from the Evil Eye. A
protective stone which keeps an eye on us. It is said to enhance our luck, inner and outer vision and giving
us the courage and ability to face and resolve our problems. Tiger's Eye is closely attuned to earth energies,
but the shimmering, eye-catching yellow highlights are linked to the sun. Tiger's Eye is a bridge between
earth and sky. It also a stone to stimulates wealth and helps to maintain it. Teaches us to see with the eye of
the tiger: clearly and without illusion. Tiger Eye is a fine stone for promoting Wealth and Money and for
holding on to it. This stone is protective, grounding its owner and dispelling the negative energies of a
chaotic world. Clears and grounds negative energy from the body. Fosters the ability to see where others
have tied themselves into you, and clear yourself of unwanted connections.

Always more Information and Content at http://www.BestAmulets.com

PROTECTION POWERS of CRYSTAL ROCK QUARTZ Gemstone:

CRYSTAL QUARTZ is a Powerful GOOD LUCK stone. It is used for protection because it counters black
magic and protects from Evil Eye. Crystal Quartz keeps negative energies away, uncover and protect
against evil attempts, prevent bad intentions and arrest bad luck.It is a stone that has the power to act as an
insulator for all things. It can stop negative vibrations and maintain positive vibrations. Crystal Quartz has
been called the "Universal Crystal", because it channels universal energy, bringing GOOD LUCK,
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FORTUNE and Overall Happiness.Crystal Quartz is a stone of clarity which dispels Evil Eye Magic and
clears away negative thoughts, which may be coming against you. It will break up negative energy in the
environment. Crystal Quartz is also good for energizing other crystals and when used in combination with
any stone it enhances that stones effects.

EVIL EYE PROTECTION POWERS of CARNELIAN Gemstone:

CARNELIAN Brings GOOD LUCK, Happiness, Success and Prosperity. Carnelian has become one of the
Power stones of the ages. It used to ward off evil thoughts, jealousy and psychic attacks toward the
individual. Carnelian is said to be the Gem of the Guardian Angel and protection from overcoming
negativity and spells. Carnelian is used to help protect you against anger and hateful feelings from
somebody. Carnelian is a Talisman to reflect the Evil Eye Energy. It can also help connect us with the Earth
and establish our link with the Universe. Carnelian can have a very positive influence on people who find
difficulties to manage their affairs due to lack of stability. It will stimulate career success and increase
energy levels. Helps in focusing and Realizing Goals.

PROTECTION POWERS of NATURAL HEMATITE Gemstone:

Hematite relates to the Mars. Determining the date when Hematite use began would be difficult but it has
probably been used since the earliest days of human civilization. The ancient Egyptians used Hematite in
the creation of their Magical Amulets such as the carpenter stone and head rest Amulets and several Heart
Amulets. Warriors in Roman times used Hematite as PROTECTION during battle. So strong was their
belief in the Power of Hematite to protect them that they thought it could even make them invincible. In
modern times, the Powers of Protection that spiritualists apply to the stone has expanded into the spiritual
realm, where they believe Hematite can transform or absorb negativity or evil. Hematite is a Lawyers stone
that brings positive judgments in legal matters and it is a stone that helps one remain true to his or her inner
self. Also a Protective Stone, whenever you feel the need for protection and face challenge in panicky
situation, carry a Hematite stone with you. It could be crucial meetings, interviews or legal matters. On a
spiritual plane, it enhances astral projections, promotes balance, focus, convergence and concentration of
energy. Helps increase courage and will-power. It helps to balance out the emotions and energies between
the body, mind and spirit. Not only does it dissolves negativity, but actually transforms it into the energy of
Universal Love. Hematite reminds you that the only limitations that exist are those that you place upon
yourself. Also offers support for your hopes, dreams, wishes and desires, by encouraging you to reach for
the sun. Hematite forms a reflective shield around its Owner, letting negativity bounce off and return to the
sender.

# # #

New Age Store offers Unique and One of the Kind Jewelry, Gemstone Gifts, Feng Shui Items, Evil Eye
Protection Charms and Natural Crystals.

--- End ---
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Scan this QR Code with your SmartPhone to-
* Read this news online
* Contact author
* Bookmark or share online
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