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Inter-American Bar Association Installs Miami Lawyer George Harper as President

The law firm of Harper Meyer Perez Hagen O’Connor & Albert LLP is proud to announce that Managing
Partner George R. Harper has recently been sworn in as president of the Inter-American Bar Association.

July 20, 2009 - PRLog -- Miami - The law firm of Harper Meyer Perez Hagen O’Connor & Albert LLP
(“Harper Meyer”) is proud to announce that Managing Partner George R. Harper has recently been sworn in
as president of the Inter-American Bar Association (the “IABA”).  Mr. Harper, who was sworn in on July
4th, 2009, at a ceremony held in conjunction with the IABA's 45th Annual Conference in Nassau, Bahamas,
is the first U.S.-based lawyer elected president of the organization since 1997.  

The election of Mr. Harper comes at a critical juncture, as Latin American demand for U.S. lawyers
continues to increase in conjunction with commercial dealings between the regions.  A U.S.-based president
will result in greater impact on U.S. domestic and international policy as the IABA will be able to promote
its agenda directly to U.S. politicians and groups with political influence.  

The newly-elected president is looking forward to an active year.  One of Mr. Harper’s principal goals as
president of the IABA will be “to strengthen the ties between the U.S. and Latin American legal
communities."  Additionally, Mr. Harper has indicated that the IABA will seek to increase its focus on
human rights issues that have a direct effect on Latin America.  

Along with long-term organizational goals, Mr. Harper is preparing for the mid-year IABA Council
Meeting, to be held at the Eden Roc Hotel in Miami Beach, Florida from October 28th to 31st, 2009. The
conference, which is being held in cooperation with the American Bar Association’s International Section,
is expected to attract more than 600 lawyers from around the world and will feature seminars and
discussions on a range of current international law topics.  

About Harper Meyer

Harper Meyer Perez Hagen O'Connor & Albert LLP is an international corporate and transactional law firm
with offices in Miami and legal networks around the world.  The attorneys at Harper Meyer are involved
with projects including aviation finance and leasing, real estate purchases and sales, complex cross-border
transactions, estate and tax planning, banking and securitization of lenders’ rights, immigration and
naturalization, communications and technology, and intellectual property licensing and protection.  For
more information on Harper Meyer, please visit www.harpermeyer.com. 

About the Inter-American Bar Association

The Inter-American Bar Association was founded on May 16, l940, by a group of distinguished lawyers
and jurists representing forty-four professional organizations and seventeen nations of the Western
Hemisphere.  The IABA provides a permanent forum for the exchange of professional views and
information for lawyers to promote the rule of law, and to protect the democratic institutions in the
Americas.  For more information on the IABA, please visit www.iaba.org.
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