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Guests Can Book Online at Hotel Topaz in Kandy, Sri Lanka

Hotel Topaz in Kandy, Sri Lanka now has an online reservation system, making it more convenient for
guests to book rooms.

Oct. 5, 2009 - PRLog -- Kandy, Sri Lanka – Guests who are looking forward to a fun vacation in Sri Lanka
can stay at Hotel Topaz. It has recently incorporated a direct reservation system on its website, making it
convenient for guests who want to book rooms. With the new user-friendly program, guests will be able to
view room rates, types, and availability for an easier booking process. In order to secure a reservation, a
10% deposit is needed via WorldPay.

The city of Kandy in Sri Lanka is a tourist destination because of numerous attractions such as The Temple
of Tooth, which is one of the most prominent Buddhist places of worship in the country, and the Old Royal
Palace, which stands as a testament to the Kandyan era.

Travelers who are on a budget will find the Hotel Topaz to their liking. The hotel is known as the “Jewel in
the Crown of Kandy” because it provides the guest with spectacular views of the famous Bible Rock and
the mountain ranges.

The rooms at this hotel are equipped with a private balcony/deck, so guests will be able to enjoy the
beautiful Sri Lankan scenery from the comfort of their air-conditioned rooms. For their convenience,
amenities such as refrigerators, satellite TV, IDD phones, Internet access, hair dryers, luggage racks and
DVD players are also included.

When not lounging in the cozy and comfortable rooms, guests can go to the Roof Top Restaurant, known
for its mouthwatering barbeque dish. There is a swimming pool, tennis court, and a spa for guests who want
to unwind as well. The spa’s Ayurvedic massage is guaranteed to add to a relaxing and pleasant vacation.
Aside from room service, there is also dry/cleaning laundry, parking, and taxi and courtesy bus service so
guests will have a stress-free stay at the hotel. For business purposes, there is a business centre,
function/meeting room, and Wi-Fi access in the lobby. The rates are inclusive of a daily breakfast and
refreshing welcome drinks upon arrival. 

For more information on this hotel and its online reservation service, visit
www.mclarenshotels.lk/topaz.html .

About Hotel Topaz

Hotel Topaz is located 118 klometers from Colombo and it boasts of breathtaking views of the famous
Bible Rock and the beautiful Sri Lankan landscape. It offers comfortable accommodations with modern
amenities and a variety of facilities and services at low rates, making it ideal for travelers who are on a
budget.

Contact Information

Hotel Topaz
Aniwatte, Kandy
Sri Lanka 
Phone Number: +94-817-389000
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Hotel Fax: +94-812-232073 

Email: anurab@mclarenshotels.lk
           topaz@mclarenshotels.lk 

Website: www.mclarenshotels.lk/topaz.html
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